BID TAB

Northern Kentucky Water District
Meter Bid Tab

2008

March 24, 2008

Badger Meter Hersey Neptune Equipment Sensus AMCO
Est Qty Item Unit Price- | Total Est | Unit Price-| Total Est Unit Price- |Total Est Costj Unit Price- Total Est Unit Price-] Total Est
Inside Cost Inside Cost Inside Inside Cost Inside Cost
Set/Wall Set/Wall Set/Wall Set/Wall Set/Wall
Mount - 25' Mount - 25' Mount - 25' Mount - 25' Mount - 25'
1,100 |5/8" Meter | $ 69.66] $ 76,626.00I $ 29.50] $ 32,450.00| $ 59.38] $ 65,318.00| $ 66.75] $ 73,425.00| $ 56.75] $ 62,425.00|
300 |5/8" x 3/4" $ 69.66] $ 20,898.00] $ 55.00] $ 16,500.00] $ 59.38] $ 17,814.000 $ 66.75| $ 20,025.000 $ 56.75] $ 17,025.00}
Meter *
50 1" Meter * $ 113.21] $ 5,660.50| $ 95.00] $ 4,750.00| $ 104.26] $ 5,213.00| $ 117.00| $ 5,850.00| $ 102.001 $ 5,100.00|
20 |1 1/2" $ 262.30] $ 5,246.000 $ 225.00] $ 4,500.00] $ 22581] $ 4,516.20] $ 251.00] $ 5,020.00§ $ 289.00] $ 5,780.00}
Meter
20 12" Meter $ 33325 $ 6,665.000 $ 280.000 $ 5,600.004 $ 30851 $ 6,170.200 $ 326.00] $ 6,520.000 $ 344.001 $ 6,880.008
(Flanged) *
Est Qty ltem Unit Price Total Est Unit Price Total Est Unit Price |Total Est Cost} Unit Price Total Est Unit Price | Total Est
for Outside Cost for Outside Cost for Outside for Outside Cost for Outside Cost
Set - 6' Set - 6' Set - 6' Cord Set - 6' Set - 6'
5,000 |5/8" Meter *| $ 72.03 $360,150.00I $ 60.00 $300,000.00I $ 62.43] $ 312,150.00' $ 69.50I $ 347,500.00' $ 56.75 $283,750.00I
1,500 |5/8"x 3/4" | $ 72.03] $108,045.00] $  60.00] $ 90,000.00f $ 62.43] $ 93,645.000 $ 69.50] $ 104,250.00§ $ 56.75] $ 85,125.00]
Meter *
100 |1" Meter * $ 113.21] $ 11,321.00| $ 105.00] $ 10,500.00| $ 104.26] $ 10,426.00| $ 120.00| $ 12,000.00| $ 102.00] $ 10,200.00|
20 |11/2" $ 262.30] $ 5,246.00] $ 235.00] $ 4,700.00§ $ 225.81] $ 4,516.20] $ 252.00] $ 5,040.00f $ 289.00] $ 5,780.00]
Meter
20 19" Matar &« 2W7ERI & A751000 & 20annnl & s52nnnnl & 20_511 & c170200 & 20000l &« AaraO NN & 24400l & A 130 Nl




Badger Meter Hersey Neptune Equipment Sensus AMCO
Est Qty Item Unit Price Total Est Unit Price Total Est Unit Price |Total Est Cost} Unit Price Total Est Unit Price | Total Est
for Outside Cost for Outside Cost for Outside for Outside Cost for Outside Cost
Set - 20' Set - 20' Set - 20’ Set - 20' Set - 20’

10 [5/8" Meter* [ $ 72.03] $ 720.30| $ 6250 $ 625.00| $ 62.43] $ 624.30| $  70.00] $ 700.00| $ 59.00] $ 590.00|

40 |5/8" x 3/4" $ 72.03] $ 2,881.200 $ 6250 $ 2,500.00] $ 62.43] $ 2497200 $ 70.00] $ 2,800.000 $ 59.00] $ 2,360.00]
Meter *

10 1" Meter * $  122.12] $ 1,221.20| $ 107.50] $ 1,075.00| $ 104.26] $ 1,042.60| $ 121.00] $ 1,210.ool $ 102.00] $ 1,020.00|

10 [11/2"Meter | $ 25585 $ 2,558500 $ 23750 $ 2,375.000 $ 22581] $ 2,258.10] $ 252.00] $ 2,520.00§ $ 295.00] $ 2,950.00}
(Flanged) *

10 2" Meter $ 33755 $ 3,375500 $ 292501 $ 2,925.000 $ 30851] $ 3,085.10] $ 329.00] $ 3,290.00§f $ 349.00] $ 3,490.00}
(Flanged) *

2 3" $ 1,290.00] $ 2,580.00I $ 1,800.00] $ 3,600.00| $ 1,195.65| $ 2,391.30| $ 1,201.00| $ 2,402.00| $ 999.00] $ 1,998.00|
Comnaund *

5 |4 $ 1,327.04] $ 6,635.20| $ 2,600.00] $ 13,ooo.oo| $ 1,736.84] $ 8,684.20| $ 1,910.oo| $ 9,550.oo| $1,287.00] $ 6,435.00|
~nmnoiind *

1 Je" $ 2,116.50] $ 2,116.50| $ 5,400.00] $ 5,4oo.oo| $ 3,138.30] $ 3,138.30' $ 3,475.00] $ 3,475.oo| $2,378.00] $ 2,378.00I
Conanoln L

1 3" Turbine* | $ 600.93] $ 600.93| $ 592.00] $ 592.oo| $ 611.70] $ 611.70] $ 566.00] $ 566.00I $ 490.00] $ 490.oo|

1 4" Turbine* | $ 704.66] $ 704.66| $  713.00] $ 713.oo| $ 1,010.64] $ 1,010.64] $ 1,010.00] $ 1,010.oo| $ 590.00] $ 590.00|

1 |6" Turbine* | $ 1,255.00] $ 1,255.oo| $ 1,480.00] $ 1,480.00| $ 164894 $ 1,648.94] $ 1,720.00| $ 1,720.oo| $1,297.00] $ 1,297.oo|

1 |8 Turbine* | $ 2,639.13] $ 2,639.13| $ 1,900.00] $ 1,900.00| $ 2712771 $  2,712.77] $ 2,620.00| $ 2,620.00I $1,903.00] $ 1,903.00'

2 3" $ 70950 $ 1,419.000 $ 878.00] $ 1,756.00] no bid| nobid] $ 664.00] $ 1,328.000 $ 789.00] $ 1,578.00}
Turbine/Strai

2 |4 $ 888.00] $ 1,776.00] $ 1,130.00] $ 2,260.00] no bid nobid] $ 1,299.00] $ 2,598.000 $ 989.00] $ 1,978.00}
Turbine/Strai

1 Je" $ 1,830.00 1,830.00] $ 2,090.00 2,090.00] no bid no bid] $ 2,225.00] $ 2,225.000 $1,632.00] $ 1,632.00}
Turbine/Strai

1 |8 $ 3,386.25] $ 3,386.25] $ 2,875.00] $ 2,875.00] no bid no bid] $ 3,310.00] $ 3,310.00] no bid no bid]
Turbine/Strai

1 [|4"Compact | $ 4,461.25] $ 4,461.25 no bid nobid] $ 4,21053] $ 4,210.53] $ 4,900.00] $ 4,900.00] $3,243.00] $ 3,243.00}
Fire Service

3 |6” Compact | $ 5,998.50] $ 17,995.50} no bid nobid] $ 5,684.21] $ 17,052.63] $ 5,700.00] $ 17,100.00] $4,472.00] $ 13,416.00}
Fire Service
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Badger Meter Hersey Neptune Equipment Sensus AMCO
Est Qty Item Unit Price | Total Est. |} Unit Price | Total Est. Unit Price Total Est. Unit Price Total Est. Unit Price | Total Est.
Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost

3 3" Bronze $ 333.00] % 999.000 $ 298.00] $ 894.000 $ 39894 $ 1,196.82] $ 204.00] $ 612.000 $ 219.32] $ 657.96
Strainer

6 4" Bronze $ 354751 $ 2,12850] $ 462.000 $ 2,772.000 $ 585.11] $ 3,510.66]Q $ 310.000 $ 1,860.000 $ 316.53] $ 1,899.18]
Strainer

2 6" Bronze $ 575.00] $ 1,150.000 $ 674.000 $ 1,348.000 $ 1,024.47] $ 2,04894) $ 543.00] $ 1,086.000 $ 555.25] $ 1,110.50)
Strainer

* All meters shall be encoder type with touch read pad and all related accessories included



	2008

