BID TAB

Northern Kentucky Water District
2009 Tires and Service

June 12, 2009
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205/75R/15 All Terrain B/W
50,000 mi. tire
215/60R/15 Mud and Snow B/W
50,000 mi. tire
215/60R/15 Mud and Snow B/W
60,000 mi. tire
235/70R/15 All Terrain B/W
50,000 mi. tire
LT235/70R/15 All Terrain B/W
50,000 mi. tire
235/85R/16 All Terrain B/W
50,000 mi./10-Ply tire
235/85R/16 Highway Tread B/W
50,000 mi./10-Ply tire
245/75R/16 All Terrain B/W
10-Ply/50,000 mi. tire
245/75R/16 Highway Tread B/W
10-Ply/60,000 mi. tire
205/70R/15 Mud and Snow B/W
50,000 mi. tire
205/70R/15 Mud and Snow B/W
60,000 mi. tire
215/70R/14 Mud and Snow B/W
50,000 mi. tire
215/70R/14 Mud and Snow B/W
60,000 mi. tire
205/70R/15 Mud and Snow B/W
50,000 mi. tire

Ziegler Tire &Supply

Unit Price Total Price

$ 67.37 $ 808.44
$ 55.85 $ 670.20

no bid no bid
$ 117.44  $ 2,348.80
$ 117.44  $ 2,348.80
$ 99.46 $ 3,978.40
$ 96.68 $ 3,867.20
$ 97.66 $ 976.60
$ 10441  $ 1,044.10
$ 68.83 $ 688.30
$ 65.36 $ 653.60
$ 7203 $ 720.30

no bid no bid
$ 68.83 $ 688.30

Best One Tire of Mid America

Unit Price Total Price
82.00 $ 984.00
63.00 $ 756.00
73.00 $ 876.00
89.00 $ 1,780.00
98.00 $ 1,960.00
96.00 $ 3,840.00
94.00 $ 3,760.00

103.00 $ 1,030.00
95.00 $ 950.00
62.00 $ 620.00
70.00 $ 700.00
62.00 $ 620.00
82.00 $ 820.00
62.00 $ 620.00

Bob Sumerel Tire Company

Unit Price Total Price
$ 69.99 $ 839.88
$ 57.99 $ 695.88
$ 59.99 $ 719.88
$ 79.99 $ 1,599.80
$ 89.99 $ 1,799.80
$ 99.99 $ 3,999.60
$ 99.99 $ 3,999.60
$ 99.99 $ 999.90
$ 99.99 $ 999.90
$ 5499 $ 549.90
$ 59.99 $ 599.90
$ 5799 $ 579.90
$ 59.99 $ 599.90
$ 5499 $ 549.90
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LT235/75R/15 All Terrain B/W
50,000 mi. tire
LT235/75R/15 Highway Tread B/W
60,000 mi. tire
LT245/75R/17 All Terrain B/W
10-Ply/50,000 mi. tire
205/75R/15 All Terrain B/W
50,000 mi. tire
215/60R/15 Mud and Snow B/W
50,000 mi. tire
215/60R/15 Mud and Snow B/W
60,000 mi. tire
235/70R/15 All Terrain B/W
50,000 mi. tire
LT235/70R/15 All Terrain B/W
50,000 mi. tire
235/85R/16 All Terrain B/W
50,000 mi/10-Ply tire
235/85R/16 Highway Tread B/W
50,000 mi/10-Ply tire
245/75R/16 All Terrain B/W
10-Ply/50,000 mi. tire
245/75R/16 Highway Tread B/W
10-Ply/60,000 mi. tire
205/70R/15 Mud and Snow B/W
50,000 mi. tire
205/70R/15 Mud and Snow B/W
60,000 mi. tire
215/70R/14 Mud and Snow B/W
50,000 mi. tire
215/70R/14 Mud and Snow B/W
60,000 mi. tire
205/70R/15 Mud and Snow B/W
50,000 mi. tire
LT235/75R/15 All Terrain B/W
50,000 mi. tire
LT235/75R/15 Highway Tread B/W
60,000 mi. tire

Ziegler Tire &Supply

Unit Price Total Price

$ 96.11 $ 1,537.76
$ 93.00 $ 1,488.00
$ 107.02 $ 1,712.32
$ 62.37 $ 748.44
$ 50.85 $ 610.20

no bid no bid
$ 11244  $ 2,248.80
$ 11244  $ 2,248.80
$ 9446 $ 3,778.40
$ 9168 $ 3,667.20
$ 92.66 $ 926.60
$ 9941 $ 994.10
$ 63.83 $ 638.30
$ 60.36 $ 603.60
$ 67.03 $ 670.30

no bid no bid
$ 6383 $ 638.30
$ 9111 $ 1,467.76
$ 88.00 $ 1,408.00

Best One Tire of Mid America

Unit Price Total Price
98.00 $ 1,568.00
89.00 $ 1,424.00

118.00 $ 1,888.00
79.00 $ 948.00
58.00 $ 696.00
68.00 $ 816.00
84.00 $ 1,680.00
93.00 $ 1,860.00
9230 $ 3,692.00
88.45 $ 3,538.00
97.15 $ 971.50
89.85 $ 898.50
57.00 $ 570.00
65.00 $ 650.00
590.00 $ 590.00
76.00 $ 760.00
79.00 $ 790.00
91.00 $ 1,456.00
84.00 $ 1,344.00

Bob Sumerel Tire Company

Unit Price Total Price
$ 89.99 $ 1,439.84
$ 89.99 $ 1,439.84
$ 179.99 $ 2,879.84
$ 66.99 $ 803.88
$ 5599 $ 671.88
$ 57.99 $ 695.88
$ 76.99 $ 1,539.80
$ 86.99 $ 1,739.80
$ 96.99 $ 3,879.60
$ 96.99 $ 3,879.60
$ 96.99 $ 969.90
$ 96.99 $ 969.90
$ 51.99 $ 519.90
$ 56.99 $ 569.90
$ 5499 $ 549.90
$ 56.99 $ 569.90
$ 5199 $ 519.90
$ 86.99 $ 1,391.84
$ 86.99 $ 1,391.84
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LT245/75R/17 All Terrain B/W
10-Ply/50,000 mi. tire
950R/16.5 Highway Tread
10-Ply, B/W tire
11R/22.5 Traction
16-Ply, B/W
11R/22.5 Steering
16-Ply, B/W
225/70R/19.5 Traction
12-Ply, B/W
225/70R/19.5 Steering
12-Ply, B/W
225/70R/19.5 Traction
14-Ply, B/W
225/70R/19.5 Steering
14-Ply, B/W
Service Call
Regular Working Hours
Service Call
After Hours

Ziegler Tire &Supply

Unit Price
$ 110.02
$ 108.43
$ 292.59
$ 299.94
$ 189.07
$ 172.07
$ 206.19
$ 189.19
$ 45.00
$ 65.00

$

©»

©»

Total Price
1,760.32
1,084.30
2,925.90
2,999.40
1,890.70
1,720.70
2,061.90
1,891.90

450.00

650.00

Best One Tire of Mid America

Unit Price
116.73
103.00
328.82
280.80
206.92
198.52
206.92
198.52

45.00

65.00

$

Total Price
1,867.68
1,030.00
3,288.20
2,808.00
2,069.20
1,985.20
2,069.20
1,985.20

450.00

650.00

$

Bob Sumerel Tire Company

Unit Price Total Price
176.99 $ 2,831.84
11799 $ 1,179.90
26299 $ 2,629.90
25599 $ 2,559.90
189.99 $ 1,899.90
169.99 $ 1,699.90
2590.99 $ 2,599.90
249.99 $ 2,499.90

35.00 $ 350.00
90.00 $ 900.00
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